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Privacy and Cybersecurity Law Internship 
Wilson Sonsini Goodrich & Rosati, Brussels 

 
Wilson Sonsini Goodrich & Rosati’s European privacy team is looking for legal interns for the firm’s privacy and 
cybersecurity practice. The European privacy team is based in Brussels and London. 
 
The privacy and cybersecurity practice advises clients of all sizes across a wide range of sectors, including 
finance, technology, life sciences, the Internet of things, social networks, connected mobility, and 
biotechnologies. The interns work in a highly motivating and challenging environment on exciting, cutting-edge 
development and expansion projects involving all aspects of EU privacy and data protection law, including: 
GDPR compliance, international data transfers strategy, data breaches and cybersecurity incidents, corporate 
transactional privacy, contract negotiation, regulatory investigations, and litigation before national courts and 
the European Court of Justice. 
 
The firm is currently looking for legal interns to be hired for a six-month period starting as soon as possible and 
offers a competitive salary package. Legal interns have the opportunity to participate in all aspects of the data 
protection practice, as well as to take on significant responsibility and work directly with senior attorneys. Legal 
interns may be able to satisfy part of their home jurisdiction’s apprenticeship requirements for admission to 
practice law.  
 
The European privacy team values excellence and collegiality, and works closely with the firm’s global privacy 
and cybersecurity practice. The team is international, and its attorneys are trained and qualified in various 
jurisdictions, including Belgium, Austria, France, Greece, Spain, Sweden, Poland, and the United Kingdom. The 
group is led by Cédric Burton and Laura De Boel, and includes Dr. Christopher Kuner. 
 
Qualifications 
 

● Strong interest and professional experience in EU privacy and data protection law. 

● Master’s degree in law (or equivalent) with excellent academic results. 

● Proficiency in English is required. Proficiency in other European languages is a plus. 

● The ideal candidate has some law firm experience. 

 

How to apply 
Please send your application via email to Martine Noyelle, Office Manager, at mnoyelle@wsgr.com with 
“Privacy Internship” in the subject line. Please include a copy of your transcripts along with your CV. 
 
About Wilson Sonsini Goodrich & Rosati 
For more than 60 years, Wilson Sonsini’s services and legal disciplines have focused on serving the principal 
challenges faced by the management and boards of directors of business enterprises. The firm is nationally 
recognized as a leading provider to growing and established clients seeking legal counsel to complete 
sophisticated corporate and technology transactions; manage governance and enterprise-scale matters; assist 
with intellectual property development, protection, and IP-driven transactions; represent them in contested 
disputes; and/or advise them on antitrust or other regulatory matters. With deep roots in Silicon Valley, Wilson 
Sonsini has 19 offices in technology and business hubs worldwide. For more information, please visit 
www.wsgr.com. 
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